HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
"AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS"
ITB 09-010
SALE OF USED SURPLUS TIRES

BID OPENING 08/07/2008

PRIDE GCR TIRE
CASING SIZE: ENTERPRISES COMPANY BIG T TIRE
10R22.5 NO BID NO BID $12.50
11R24.5 $40.51 $15.00 $5.00
P265/70R16 NO BID NO BID NO BID
18.4X34 NO BID NO BID $5.00
11R 22.5 $40.51 $41.65 NO BID
255/70R22.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
17.5 X 25 NO BID NO BID $5.00
17.5R X 25 NO BID NO BID $5.00
20.5 X 25 NO BID NO BID $5.00
23.5X25 NO BID NO BID $5.00
16.9 X 30 NO BID NO BID $5.00
18.4 X 30 NO BID NO BID $5.00
215/85R16 NO BID NO BID $0.50
235/85R16 NO BID NO BID $0.50
26.5R25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
235/75R15 NO BID NO BID $1.00
245/75R16 NO BID NO BID $0.50
225/75R16 NO BID NO BID $0.50
385/65R22.5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
425/65R22.5 $7.50 NO BID NO BID

RECOMMEND ACCEPTING HIGH BIDS FROM ALL VENDORS FOR ITEMS BID FOR 12
MONTH PERIOD 10/01/2008 THRU 09/30/2009

PRIDE ENTERPRISES INCLUDED A PRICE OF $10.00 FOR TIRE 315/80R22.5
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